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internal organs, particularly respiratory organ injury. Similar findings 
were given by Lisi et al. who reported significantly higher CXCL1 levels 
in Sjögren's syndrome (SS) tissues than in healthy controls. Though 
there are few reports that support a potential role of CXCL1 throughout 
inflammation and neovascularization in reaction diseases, we have a 
tendency to examined CXCL1 in systemic lupus erythematosus serum 
during this study. The results showed that serum CXCL1 levels were 
considerably exaggerated in patients with systemic lupus erythematosus 
compared with patients with different reaction diseases, as well as SS 
and SSc. However, Furuse et al. did not observe higher serum CXCL1 
levels in general autoimmune disease patients. To boot to the excellence 
between patients assessed, these discrepant results might even be due 
to the small sample numbers analyzed or low sensitivity of the assay 
system used. This report evaluated entirely 15 patients with general 
autoimmune disease. Moreover, we've an inclination to any assessed 
the restrictive response of serum CXCL1 levels and anti-dsDNA 
immune globulin levels in active general autoimmune disease patients 
once treatment. Finally, our study provides a clinical analysis of the 
CXCL1 serum levels in general autoimmune disease patients. CXCL1 
serum concentrations may be accustomed differentiate malady activity 

between general autoimmune disease and LN. Moreover, the co-
occurrence of immune globulin ANA and hour angle immune globulin 
ANAs might even be associated with the CXCL1 levels in patients with 
general autoimmune disease. Therefore, the chemokine CXCL1 might 
even be concerned inside the pathogenesis/inflammatory technique in 
lupus.
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