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Introduction
Harmful weighty metal contamination is a widespread natural concern. 
It can prompt defilement of soil that can represent a serious danger to the 
entire biosphere. A polluted site can become disturbing for general well-
being and climate. Contamination might be of normal or anthropogenic 
beginning. Utilizing plants to manage this issue is a universally famous 
strategy that has an extreme lower cost. The plant based biotechnology 
to more readily deal with this worldwide concern is called phytoreme-
diation. Soil is the highest layer of earth that helps plants develop and 
upholds life. Soil is named as tainted when the grouping of toxins sur-
passes the breaking point beneath the foundation level. Defilement of 
soils has been on ascent because of extraordinary agronomic and modern 
exercises. Weighty metals collected in the dirt can't be biodegraded con-
sequently soils should be remediated [1-3].The significant expenses and 
shortcoming renders the conventional techniques, similar to exhuming, 
for soil treatment insufficient. Phytoremediation has an extraordinary 
likely as far as cleaning impurities that are covering an enormous region 
and are close to the surface and furthermore is exceptionally ecological 
well disposed.

Metalliferous soils have unconventionally high grouping of minor com-
ponents (for example Mn 200-2000 mg/kg) or follow constituents (0.01-
200 mg/kg, for example Zn, Cr, As, Co, Cu, Ni, Se, and Cd). Numerous 
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parts of a plant. The bioaccumulation coefficient (BAC) is used to evalu-
ate the efficiency of a plant in phytoremediation and translocation. The 
accumulation coefficient can also be defined as the plant to soil concen-
tration quotient. Bio-concentration factor is the ratio of metal concen-
tration in plant roots to the concentration of metal accumulated in soil 
[8-10]. These factors are the renowned parameters for determining hyper 
accumulating plant species. It has also been observed that members of 
same family have similar phyto-remediating abilities. Most commonly 
accumulated heavy metals are cadmium, zinc, nickel and copper.  

Conclusion
Different plant species require different growing conditions to hyper ac-
cumulate heavy metals. Moreover, not all the plant tissues store equal 
quantity of heavy metals. Some plant species are good at accumulating 
heavy metals more in their roots as compared to shoots or leaves. This 
may also vary with the elements being accumulated. Mathematical cal-
culations and soil profile analysis before and after treatment provides 
evidence of the hyper accumulation of heavy metals.  

Recommendation
Pakistan is facing the problem of severe soil and water pollution. This 
data should be used for the field application of hyper accumulators in 
Pakistan. This is a cheap, secure and ecofriendly way of bioremediation 
which has showed excellent results in contamination removal.

References
1.	 Bert V, Bonnin I, Saumitou‐Laprade P, De Laguérie P,   Petit D et al.  

(2002) Do Arabidopsis halleri from nonmetallicolous populations 
accumulate zinc and cadmium more effectively than those from 
metallicolous populations? New Phytologist 155(1):47-57.

2.	 Bini C (2010) From soil contamination to land restoration: Nova 
Science Publishers New York (NY).

3.	 Chaney RL, Baklanov IA (2017) Phytoremediation and phytomin-
ing: status and promise. In Advances in botanical research Elsevier 
83:189-221.

4.	 Flora SJS (2014) Handbook of arsenic toxicology: Academic Press.

5.	 Kausar S, Mahmood Q, Raja IA, Khan A, Sultan S, et al. (2012) Po-
tential of Arundo donax to treat chromium contamination.  Else-
vier 42: 256-259. 

6.	 Leung DW (2013) Recent advances towards improved phytoreme-
diation of heavy metal pollution New Zealand: Bentham Science 
Publishers.

7.	 Maestri E, Marmiroli M, Visioli G. Marmiroli N (2010) Metal tol-
erance and hyperaccumulation: costs and trade-offs between traits 
and environment. Environmental Experimental Botany 68(1): 1-13.

8.	 Malaisse F, Gregoire J, Brooks R, Morrison (2015) Aeolanthus bi-
formifolius De Wild.: a hyperaccumulator of copper from Zaire. 
Science 199(4331): 887-888.

9.	 Martos S, Gallego B, Sáez L, López-Alvarado J, (2016) Character-
ization of zinc and cadmium hyperaccumulation in three Noccaea 
(Brassicaceae) populations from non-metalliferous sites in the east-
ern Pyrenees. Frontiers in plant science 7: 128.

10.	 Mesjasz-Przybyłowicz, J, Nakonieczny M, Migula P, Augustyniak 


