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Introduction
Overfishing is one of the leading causes of marine species extinction. 

Fishing boats use various methods like bottom trawling and longlining, 
which catch not only the target fish but also unintended species like 
sharks, turtles, and dolphins. This bycatch results in the death of these 
non-target species, leading to their decline and eventual extinction [1].

Methodology
The destruction of habitats like coral reefs, mangroves, and seagrass 

beds is another significant cause of marine species extinction. Human 
activities like coastal development, pollution, and climate change are 
destroying these habitats, which are home to many marine species.

Climate change is causing the oceans to warm up and become more 
acidic, which is affecting marine species in many ways. For instance, 
corals, which are home to many fish species, are bleaching and dying 
due to the increased temperatures. Additionally, the increased acidity 
is affecting the growth and development of many shell-forming species 
like oysters and clams.

Pollution from land-based sources like sewage, fertilizers, and 
chemicals is also affecting marine species. The runoff from these sources 
leads to eutrophication, which causes oxygen depletion in the water and 
leads to the death of marine species like fish and shellfish [2, 3].
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marine species, leaving them with nowhere to live and breed. Pollution 
is also a severe threat to marine species, with plastics, chemicals, and 
oil spills causing harm to animals and their habitats. Climate change 
is also affecting marine species, with rising temperatures and ocean 
acidification impacting the ability of many species to survive.

Consequences of marine extinction

The consequences of marine extinction are far-reaching, with 
implications for the environment, economy, and human well-being. 
One of the most significant impacts of marine extinction is the loss of 
biodiversity, which can destabilize entire ecosystems. Marine species 
play a vital role in regulating the ocean ecosystem, from controlling 
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