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As a clinical ethics consultant for the past 20 years or so, I have seen 
many situations where dying patients or their surrogates make decisions 
that cause considerable concern and moral stress to physicians and 
particularly to nurses who are continually at the patient’s bedside. In an 
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physician is just that: advice. When the actual moment comes, when 
the patients stops breathing and heart stops, the physicians decide what 
to do.

In cases like this one, physicians want to do what is right. But they 
want to be sure they are within the guidelines of the law. How the 
physician eventually acted in this case is not as relevant as the fact that 
physicians across the country, across the state, in the same hospital or 
even on the same service o�en di�er on how they manage such cases. 
Clearly this type of case goes to the heart of the intersection between 
clinical ethics and palliative care.

�ere is a serious need for more discussion of what ethical and 
legal standards to employ in such cases. We need to consider point at 
which the obligation to provide palliative care overrides the prima facie 
obligation to respect the patient’s or surrogate’s directives. But most 
importantly, these cases cry out for greater involvement of palliative 
care and ethics consultation, at a much earlier stage in the course of 
treatment for seriously ill patients. It is much easier to obviate the 

possibility of con�ict and discord if patient and family concerns and 
needs are addressed at an earlier point in the case. Too o�en, ethics 
consultations occur at the �nal stages of a patient’s life, where a dramatic 
and excruciatingly di�cult decision has to be made. Physicians need to 
be better prepared to utilize the services of palliative care and ethics 
consultation at a point where there is more time for discussion and 
planning so as to avert end of life crises. Such a change will require 
more education and a move toward more de�nitive practice standards 
in the management of seriously ill patients.
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