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Introduction
Noroviruses (NVs) cause most outbreaks of acute gastroenteritis 

and account for 267 million infections and more than 200,000 deaths 
each year.1 Strains belonging to genotype GII.4 have led to 6 pandemics 
since 1995 and pose a major health and economic burden. Numerous 
challenges have hampered the study of NVs and the development of an 
e�ective vaccine. Such challenges include the inability to propagate NVs 
in established cell lines; the rapid emergence of novel GII.4 strains that 
escape herd immunity; and the complexity of host exposure histories 
and determinants of susceptibility, which complicate the interpretation 
of immunologic studies. Consequently, key questions, such as what 
constitutes an e�ective and durable NV immune response, remain 
unanswered [1].

In this issue of Cellular and Molecular Gastroenterology and 
Hepatology, Lindesmith a particularly important and understudied 
area of human NV research: the cellular immune response following 
acute infection. Most studies to date have focused on humoraTw bie,7375 Tw Tar imbilant ate hashow
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α-1,2-fucosyltransferase, an enzyme involved in HBGA synthesis. 
Known as “nonsecretors,” such subjects have a limited repertoire of 
HBGAs and are naturally resistant to most NV strains, including GII.4 
variants [3]. �e authors carry out broad phenotypic and functional 
analysis of the immune response at days 8, 30, and 180 following 
natural infection with a GII.2 virus, focusing on both adaptive and 
innate immune responses. Moreover, they take advantage of the limited 
exposure history of this cohort to interrogate the cross-reactivity of 
GII.2-speci�c T cells against GII.4 virus-like particles. Because most 
adults have had multiple NV exposures, this is a clever approach to 
address the issue of preexisting versus cross-protective immunity. 
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fashion as to create hollows or cup-like structures on the virus surface 
[8]. Hence, calici is derived from the Latin word calyx, or “cup”. ORF-
1 encodes a polyprotein that is proteolytically processed into the 6 
nonstructural proteins, including the norovirus protease and RNA-
dependent RNA polymerase.
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